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Abstract 
This article aims to find the reasons why the Finnish organic food chain has not developed sufficiently to 
reach the goals the authorities have set for production volume and consumption. The reason is partly that 
organic products do not meet the quality needs of consumers, and that consumers have been left out of the 
development of the food chain and decision-making for food selection. The criteria for evaluating the 
stakeholders’ actions and results are only quantitative and financial, instead of being qualitative and being 
built on accommodating to the values of the consumers. According to extensive research into consumers’ 
opinions on organic production and food, people value safety, ecology, health, ethicality and taste. By adding 
those factors to the evaluation criteria the food suppliers would enlist consumers as co-creators and enable 
the stakeholders of organic food production to better face the challenges and meet the goals set for the 
organic food chain.    
Introduction 
The Finnish Government has set several goals for the development of the organic food system in Finland 
(MMM 2001, MMM 2012, MMM 2013, Aakkula et al. 2006). None of the previous goals have been reached. 
Several other European Union countries, such as Denmark, Austria, Germany and Sweden, have higher 
volumes of production and consumption in the organic food than Finland (Willer, Kilcher 2012, Willer 2012). 
In many countries, the food chain is driven by retail markets and the food industry. Decision-making 
regarding the quality of the food chain and its products is not based on consumers’ values and needs. It is 
based only on quantitative facts such as profitability (Aakkula et al. 2006, Kuosmanen, Niemi 2009, Kottila 
2010, Kottila, Rönni 2008, Kottila, Rönni 2006). In this article, the principles of co-creation theory are 
integrated into the activity theory frame (Engeström 1987) in the Finnish food chain concept in order to 
identify the weak points of the food chain and to present a solution for reaching the goals set for the 
development of the organic food chain in Finland.         

Material and methods  
This article uses Yrjö Engeström’s model of Vygotsky’s Activity Theory (Engeström 1987, Engeström 1995, 
Engeström 2008). The theory has been used successfully in many different concepts, including the organic 
food chain concept (Seppänen 2004). This model of the system’s activity offers a tool for analysing the inter-
relationships among the elements of the system like the food chain (Burnard, Younker 2008). It also gives us 
a tool for identifying institutional barriers and planning future activities (Yamagata-Lynch, Smaldino 2007). 
The theory forms a triangle (Figure 1), in which the actors and actions of the Finnish food chain might appear 
as follows: Subject: the companies and operators separately with no co-operation (Kottila, Rönni 2006), 
Tools: doing business to reach the object, and Object: earning money. There are also other factors: Rules: 
everyone’s own rules and company culture, Community: there is no food-chain level co-operation, Division of 
labour: unfair competition, increased price margins (Kuosmanen, Niemi 2009) and Outcome of the activity: 
does not lead to the development of the organic food chain. Some other factors were implemented in this, 
Engeström’s activity theory model: The link between the food chain and the consumers is weak; the 
evaluation of the quality of the food chain process and food is based only on the quantitative aspects, not on 
consumers’ needs (Kottila 2010), and the government’s interaction with the rules of the food chain is weak.  
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Figure 1. The situation of the Finnish food chain in Engeström’s theory  

 
Because the consumers have been left out of the food chain, the principles of co-creation theory are also 
used to solve the problem of the underdevelopment of the Finnish organic food chain. The main idea of co-
creation theory is to get the customers (consumers) involved in the creation and development of products 
and services as co-creators (Gylden 2012, Zwick et al. 2008). That will ensure that the products are 
accepted by the user. According to many studies on consumers’ willingness to use organic products, safety, 
ecology, health, ethicality and taste have been found to be the most important factors (Sirieix et al. 2006, De 
Lorenzo et al. 2010, Oughton 2009, Midmore et al. 2005, Ness et al. 2010). 

Results 
If the consumer’s values and opinions are introduced into the activity of the food chain, the evaluation criteria 
for the activity and business results (object) would also be qualitative such as safety, ecology, health, 
ethicality and taste. That would force the food chain operators into mutual target setting and improved co-
operation (subject, rules and community). The government’s improved interaction to the widening price 
margins would reduce unfair competition. With regulations and taxation (Schou, Streibig 1999, Millock et al. 
2004) the government could develop the organic food chain towards the goals it has set. Figure 2 shows 
thechanges needed o reach the goals set by the Finnish government.  

Discussion 
The organic food system gives us a model for a more sustainable food system. It has several challenges to 
meet and to be accepted by the food chain stakeholders. Only by listening to the consumers’ needs and 
values and taking those among the criteria for evaluating the quality of the food production process and food 
will the organic food chain develop to meet better the goals set for its production and consumption. The 
government’s interaction with the food system is needed in the form of more effective taxation, subsidy 
policies and legislation. Those should guide us towards better sustainability.    

Suggestions for tackling future challenges of organic animal husbandry 
The future of organic animal husbandry is dependent on meat consumption and the co-operation of its stake 
holders. The consumers’ willingness to buy organic meat products is based on their own values. The food-
related scandals make transparency of the meat chain important. The consumers should be better aware of 
the positive effects of the organic production method for the ethicality and ecology of production as well as 
the safety, healthiness and taste of meat products. 
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Figure 2. The changes needed to reach the goals set by the Finnish government  
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